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CHAMPIONSHIP 
  

Saturday, September 28 
 
 A chilly day on Saturday, the beginning of the fall golf season, with Ray and Phil taking on Pete and Matt in a traditional 
match play format.  Tee shots were directly into the rising sun, no need to look up, and Matt started with a good ball that stopped 
in the left rough, followed by Pete with a high and short tee shot.  Phil hit a nice cut from the tee into the fairway, followed by Ray 
with a nice shot that was just behind Matt.  Ray missed the green with the shorter of the two approaches for his team but Phil hit 
his own iron to about ten feet.  Pete had to hit a hybrid for the distance and reached the front edge, but Matt hit a good shot 
inside of Phil to six feet.  Ray and Pete each left themselves four feet after their longer putts, and Ray followed by making his par 
to give Phil a free shot at birdie.  Pete unfortunately did not save his par, and when Matt’s birdie putt rolled four feet past, he had 
to continue and make his second putt to tie Phil and Ray.  A good stroke and a four to halve the hole.  Matt hit his hybrid onto 
the right side of the eleventh green, Pete on the hill to the right, Phil in the left side bunker and Ray on the road and out of the 
hole.  Pete could not recover, leaving the hole to Phil and Matt.  Phil came out of the bunker about ten feet above the cup, Matt 
rolled his birdie putt six feet below the cup.  Phil, with coaching from his partner, rolled his putt true into the center of the cup, 
and Matt held up under pressure by making his par as well.  Matt was left on twelve, Pete farther left into the trees, and Phil and 
Ray both on the right side in the rough.  Phil came out to off the front edge of the green, bested by Ray who stopped his 
approach four feet from the cup, Pete with an even better shot from the woods to two feet from the cup.  Matt mishit his wedge 
and did not make the green but made up for it with a good chip that left a par putt conceded.  Neither Ray nor Pete could convert 
their birdie putts, however, so fours halved the hole and kept the match square.  All tee shots started left on thirteen, but all but 
Pete rolled back to the right and into the fairway.  Ray hit a nice shot that ended up at the back of the green, Phil through the 
trees and over the hump to the left of the hole, Matt pushing his shot to the right.  Phil hit a chip that left him putting for a net two, 
followed by Ray’s birdie putt that was quite short, and Matt’s chip that stayed six feet below the hole.  Phil stroked a good first 
putt and was conceded his net four, leaving Matt to make his uphill tester off the little mogul, which he did to tie the hole.  Pete 
hit a branch and came down in the rough on fourteen, Matt’s five wood into the fairway, Phil with a good tee shot onto the 
fairway and Ray with a better tee shot beyond the other three.  Pete recovered with a second shot down the hill and the others 
also got to the bottom for their second shots.  Phil came up short of the green in three but still had an extra stroke, Ray with a 
good shot that left him a long putt but able to make his par.  Matt was six feet away, Pete even better at four feet.  Matt missed 
his putt but Pete made his birdie, a four that was needed because Phil made his long putt with coaching from his partner for a 
net four, and we were still even.  Pete was on the hill on fifteen, Matt on the green with a long putt, Phil on the right side of the 
green about twenty feet away and Ray with the best tee shot that unfortunately went through the green.  Pete hit a chip that was 
lucky to hit the pin, stopping just a foot away for his par.  Ray chipped to three feet and had a chance to make his par as well.  
Matt missed his birdie on the low side and settled for par as well.  Phil stroked his putt well, sliding inches outside the cup and 
conceded par, so four pars tied the hole and the match stayed even going up the hill.  Pete and Matt hit good tee shots on 
sixteen to about one hundred fifty yards from the green, with Phil and Ray also good but a bit shorter.  Phil went to the right with 
his approach, Ray following and going into the bunker, Pete into the left bunker and Matt onto the front edge of the green with a 
long birdie putt.  Ray saved the day for his team, coming out of the trap to ten feet and after Matt missed his birdie putt by inches 
and made par, stroked his fourth shot dead center of the hole to tie and keep the match square.   Matt was left of the road on 
seventeen, Pete to the right and possibly out of bounds.  Ray pulled to the left but Phil found the fairway on a hole where he also 
had an extra stroke.  Pete’s ball stayed in and he hit his second to about one hundred twenty yards from the green, followed by a 
good recovery by Matt who threaded the trees to seventy yards, then Ray to the far side of the fairway and Phil to the left.  Pete 
could not save his hole, nor could Ray but Matt made his bogey after a good approach and Phil also recovered to make his net 
six to again tie the hole.  Everything was even, no holes won yet, as we went to eighteen.  Pete and Matt had the tee box for the 
ninth consecutive hole and Matt led off with a good tee shot, followed by a good shot from his partner, Pete.  Phil pulled his tee 
shot short and to the left, as did Ray, who was in the clearing.  Phil tried to recover and hit a good second and third shot but did 
not make his par.  Ray hit a beautiful second shot just short of the green and behind the trap, giving him a chance for par.  Pete 
found the green, as did Matt with a good forward bounce.  Pete had the longer putt and gave it a try for birdie but just missed, 
tapping in for par and giving Matt a free shot at three.  Matt narrowly missed and settled for par, and it was up to Ray to try to 
match.  Having hit a good chip to five feet, the putt was possible but difficult.  When the ball rolled just outside the hole, the first 
blood of the day was drawn and Pete and Matt won the most closely contested match of the year…one up.   
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